
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 18-0023

 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for Portland Cement, Ready Mix (Quickrete)

FOR: and Asphalt Cold Patch Bags

TIME & (Date of Award through September 30, 2020)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 29, 2018
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

600 bags UNIT *     

Portland Cement PRICE 10.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. (SAWS Stock #10310) TOTAL 6,162.00     

 

Alamo Portland     

Brand Name Product #112442     

7,000 bags UNIT *     

Concrete, Ready Mix, Size 80 lbs, Brand Quikrete, Part #1101 or approved equal PRICE 3.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. (SAWS Stock #10312) TOTAL 24,920.00     

Quikrete     

Brand Name Product #1101     

10,000 bags *     

Asphalt Cold Patch, Commercial Grade, Permanent Black Top, 60 lb. bags

Mfg. Quickcrete P/N 1701-62, or approved equal 11.95 13.00 16.00 NO BID NO BID

3. (SAWS Stock #44459) 119,500.00 130,000.00 160,000.00   

  Oldcastle   

Brand Name Product   NVM   

1,000 bags *

Concrete, Ready Mix Maximizer, Size 80 lbs., Brand Sakrete, Part #5050 9.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. or approved equal (SAWS Stock #49942) 9,530.00     

Sakrete     

Brand Name Product #5050     

20 ea. *

Pallet Fee 15.00 NO BID 15.00 NO BID NO BID

5. (SAWS Stock #22381) 300.00  300.00   

 

TOTAL ONE YEAR TOTAL 160,412.00    

TOTAL TWO YEARS TOTAL 320,824.00

EXTENSION 1 160,412.00

EXTENSION 2 160,412.00

 

EXTENSION 3 160,412.00

 

EXTENSION 4 160,412.00

Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days

 

Delivery Days 10 days 7 days

   

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

AIW Lynwood Demandstar

 Core & Main Mapa Distributors SAWS Website

Dittmar MSC Direct

Fastenal Mustang Equip
Grainger Royall Matthiessen

HD Supply Sunbelt Mill Supply

Hei-Way White Cap

KLP Commercial, LLC
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